

RECORD OF THE PROCEEDINGS  
SKAGIT COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS

Monday, May 2, 1988

Flag Salute

10:30 a.m. Public Works Department - Jay Ensley, Director:

1. Signature - Final Records - Francis Road.
2. Resolution - C.R.P. Revision - Little Mountain Road.
3. Signature - City/County Agreements for Various Proposed Railroad Crossing Improvements:
  - a. March Point Road.
  - b. South Texas Road.
  - c. Hickox Road.
  - d. Gardner Road.
  - e. Garden-of-Eden Road.
4. Update - Resource Recovery Facility.
5. Miscellaneous Items.

MISCELLANEOUS ITEMS

- 1:30 p.m.
1. Bid Opening - Highway Paint Striping.
  2. Bid Opening - Rock and Gravel Products.
  3. Bid Opening - Asphalt Mix Products.
  4. Bid Opening - Liquid Asphalt Products.

MISCELLANEOUS ITEMS

The Skagit County Board of Commissioners met in regular session on Monday, May 2, 1988, with Commissioners Walberg and Rohrer present. Chairman Vaux's absence was excused.

PUBLIC WORKS DEPARTMENT - Jay Ensley, Director:

- i. Signature - Final Records - Francis Road.

Commissioner Walberg motioned to adopt the resolution (Revision #2) authorizing additional funds in the amount of \$12,652.06 for engineering, right-of-way acquisition and construction to cover four approved change orders necessary for the reconstruction of Francis Road. Commissioner Rohrer seconded the motion. The motion was carried and so ordered. (Resolution #11565)

The Board approved for signature the final records for the Francis Road construction project. The total project cost was \$76,431.06.

2. Resolution - C.R.P. Revision - Little Mountain Road.

Commissioner Walberg motioned to adopt the resolution (Revision #1) authorizing additional funds in the amount of \$15,000 for right-of-way acquisition necessary for the reconstruction of Little Mountain Road from Milepoint 0.00 to Milepoint 0.53. Commissioner Rohrer seconded the motion. The motion was carried and so ordered. (Resolution #11566)

3. Signature - City/County Agreements for Various Proposed Railroad Crossing Improvements:

- a. March Point Road.
- b. South Texas Road.
- c. Hickox Road.
- d. Gardner Road.
- e. Garden-of-Eden Road.

The Board approved for signature Washington State Department of Transportation City/County Agreements for the installation of automatic flashing light traffic control devices at the above-referenced railroad crossings. The Federal aid participation rate for these projects is expected to be 90 percent.

4. Update - Resource Recovery Facility.

Bill Ness, Solid Waste Engineer, presented minutes from the April 29, 1988, weekly site meeting at the resource recovery facility. Mr. Ness reviewed various aspects of the project with the Board.

Commissioner Rohrer suggested a night watchman should be retained to guard the facility against vandalism.

Jay Ensley felt at this time the responsibility for such a precaution was with the contractor.

Mr. Ness assured the Board that he will contact the contractor for further consideration of this matter.

5. Miscellaneous Items.

Jeff Monsen, County Engineer, presented a poster sponsored by the Washington Traffic Safety Commission and Community D.W.I. Task Forces. Mr. Monsen noted that Don McKeehen, D.W.I./Safety Belt Project Coordinator for Skagit County, had provided the photography for the poster.

MISCELLANEOUS ITEMS

1. The Board approved for signature Contract #2490-62269(2) with the Department of Social and Health Services for the transfer of \$11,200 in funding from Skagitron to Valley Homes and Pacific North Community Services for the period beginning May 1, 1988, through June 30, 1988.
2. Commissioner Walberg motioned to approve the Record of the Proceedings for Monday, April 25, 1988; Tuesday, April 26, 1988; and Wednesday, April 27, 1988. Commissioner Rohrer seconded the motion. The motion was carried and so ordered.
3. Commissioner Walberg motioned to approve the following Petitions for Property Tax Refund, as recommended by the Skagit County Assessor and Treasurer:
  - a. Dwayne Ruckdashel, 2301 G Avenue, Anacortes, Washington 98221, in the amount of \$62.41, due to a reduction by the Board of Tax Appeals per Docket #32465. (#001988)
  - b. Lilly M. Swanson, 1849 Cook Road, Burlington, Washington 98233, in the amount of \$617.52, due to senior citizen exemption. (#003888)
  - c. Maurice E. Collins, P.O. Box 665, Mount Vernon, Washington 98273, in the amount of \$358.80, due to senior citizen exemption. (#003788)

Commissioner Rohrer seconded the motion. The motion was carried and so ordered.

4. Vouchers audited and certified by the auditing officer as required by R.C.W. 42.24.080, and those expense reimbursement claims certified as required by R.C.W. 42.24.090, have been recorded on a listing which has been made available to the Board.

As of this date, May 2, 1988, the Board, by a majority vote, did approve for payment those vouchers included in the above-mentioned list and further described as follows:

- a. Vouchers #73938 through #74075 (Warrants #73938 through #74075) in the total amount of \$255,165.24. (PR/08/88)
- b. Vouchers #880088 through #880112 (Warrants #11248 through #11687) in the total amount of \$628,905.20. (P/04/88)

BID OPENING - HIGHWAY PAINT STRIPING.

Commissioner Rohrer waived the reading of the Notice of Call for Bids, as published in the Skagit Argus on April 19, and April 26, 1988.

The following bids were received:

1. Rockey's Road Striping Co.  
916 Garden Hill Road  
Elma, WA 98541
  - b. How many gallons of paint can you carry without returning for refill? 700 gallons of paint;  
2,000 pounds of beads
  - c. List approximate number of paint miles you can spray per hour, centerline: 12 miles
  - d. List approximate number of paint miles you can spray per hour, edges: 12 miles
  - e. List your hourly rate for striping: \$121.50
  - f. List your hourly rate for standby during periods of poor weather or for other reasons outside your control: No charge
2. Arctic Striping, Inc.  
9609 15th S.W.  
Seattle, WA 98106
  - b. How many gallons of paint can you carry without returning for refill? 600 gallons
  - c. List approximate number of paint miles you can spray per hour, centerline: 10 miles
  - d. List approximate number of paint miles you can spray per hour, edges: 10 miles
  - e. List your hourly rate for striping: \$156.00
  - f. List your hourly rate for standby during periods of poor weather or for other reasons outside your control: No charge

The Public Works Department will review the bids prior to making a recommendation to the Board for award of the bid at a later date.

BID OPENING - ROCK AND GRAVEL PRODUCTS.

Commissioner Rohrer waived the reading of the Notice of Call for Bids, as published in the Skagit Argus on April 19, and April 26, 1988.

Bids were received from the following bidders:

1. B. A. Van De Grift  
2310 Benham Road  
Mount Vernon, WA 98273
2. Associated Sand & Gravel Company, Inc.  
6300 Glenwood Avenue, P.O. Box 2037  
Everett, WA 98203
3. Concrete Nor'West  
1378 South Garl Street  
Burlington, WA 98233
4. Lakeside Industries  
P.O. Box 729  
Anacortes, WA 98221

A detailed listing of the bids received is attached. The Public Works Department will review the bids prior to compiling a list of eligible suppliers for these products for the period beginning May 1, 1988, and continuing through April 30, 1989.

BID OPENING - ASPHALT MIX PRODUCTS.

Commissioner Rohrer waived the reading of the Notice of Call for Bids, as published in the Skagit Argus on April 19, and April 26, 1988.

The following bids were received:

1. Lakeside Industries  
P.O. Box 729  
Anacortes, WA 98221

Plant Location: 700 Old Highway 99 North  
Burlington, WA 98233

- |    |   |         |
|----|---|---------|
| a. | Price per ton of ATB at supplier's plant:       | \$13.80 |
| b. | Price per ton of Class "B" at supplier's plant: | \$17.00 |
| c. | Price per ton of Class "G" at supplier's plant: | \$18.00 |
| d. | Price per ton of cold mix:                      | NO BID  |

Plant Location: 1165 Havekost Road  
Anacortes, WA 98221

- a. Price per ton of ATB at supplier's plant: \$16.50
- b. Price per ton of Class "B" at supplier's plant: \$19.50
- c. Price per ton of Class "G" at supplier's plant: \$19.50
- d. Price per ton of cold mix: At supplier's plant: \$25.00  
Delivered to Burlington: \$28.00

2. EPM Asphaltec, Inc.  
Box 1100, 1850 Hillside Avenue  
Coquitlam, B.C. V3J 627

- a. Price per ton of ATB at supplier's plant: NO BID
- b. Price per ton of Class "B" at supplier's plant: NO BID
- c. Price per ton of Class "G" at supplier's plant: NO BID
- d. Price per ton of cold mix: At supplier's plant: \$64.00  
Delivered to Burlington: \$78.00

3. Associated Sand & Gravel Company, Inc.  
6300 Glenwood Avenue, P.O. Box 2037  
Everett, WA 98203

- a. Price per ton of ATB at supplier's plant: \$13.50
- b. Price per ton of Class "B" at supplier's plant: \$16.90
- c. Price per ton of Class "G" at supplier's plant: \$18.00
- d. Price per ton of cold mix: At supplier's plant: \$25.00  
Delivered to Burlington: \$28.00

4. Wilder Paving Products  
3315 15th Street  
Everett, WA 98201

- a. Price per ton of ATB at supplier's plant: \$17.50
- b. Price per ton of Class "B" at supplier's plant: \$23.00
- c. Price per ton of Class "G" at supplier's plant: \$23.00
- d. Price per ton of cold mix: At supplier's plant: \$30.00  
Delivered to Burlington: NO BID

The Public Works Department will review the bids prior to compiling a list of eligible suppliers for these products for the period beginning May 1, 1988, and continuing through April 30, 1989.

BID OPENING - LIQUID ASPHALT PRODUCTS.

Commissioner Rohrer waived the reading of the Notice of Call for Bids, as published in the Skagit Argus on April 19, and April 26, 1988.

The following bids were received:

1. U.S. Oil & Refining Co.  
P.O. Box 2255  
Tacoma, WA 98401
  - a. Price per ton of MC-250: \$155.20
  - b. Price per ton of CMS-2: \$115.20
  - c. Price per ton of CSS-1: \$115.20
  - d. Price per ton of dust oil: \$110.20
  - e. Price per ton of HF-150S: NO BID\*
  - \* Alternate Bid Offer: CRS-2PH: \$155.80
  
2. Koch Materials Company  
19770 101st Avenue  
Langley, B.C., Canada V3A 4P8
  - a. Price per ton of MC-250: NO BID
  - b. Price per ton of CMS-2: NO BID
  - c. Price per ton of CSS-1: NO BID
  - d. Price per ton of dust oil: NO BID
  - e. Price per ton of HF-150S: Delivered to Burlington: \$126.95
  
3. Chevron U.S.A., Inc., Asphalt Division  
P.O. Box 220  
Seattle, WA 98111
  - a. Price per ton of MC-250: \$153.60
  - b. Price per ton of CMS-2: \$104.60
  - c. Price per ton of CSS-1: \$104.60
  - d. Price per ton of dust oil: NO BID
  - e. Price per ton of HF-150S: NO BID

The Public Works Department will review the bids, prior to compiling a list of eligible suppliers for these products for the period beginning May 1, 1988, and continuing through April 30, 1989.

MISCELLANEOUS ITEMS

There were no miscellaneous items to address at this time.

ADJOURNMENT

Commissioner Walberg motioned to adjourn the proceedings. Commissioner Rohrer seconded the motion. The motion was carried and so ordered.

BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS  
SKAGIT COUNTY, WASHINGTON



\_\_\_\_\_  
W. W. Vaux, Chairman

Otto M. Walberg, Jr.  
\_\_\_\_\_  
Otto M. Walberg, Jr., Commissioner

Dave Rohrer  
\_\_\_\_\_  
Dave Rohrer, Commissioner

ATTEST:

Megan Cheney  
\_\_\_\_\_  
Megan Cheney, Clerk  
Skagit County Board of Commissioners



SKAGIT COUNTY PUBLIC WORKS DEPARTMENT  
ELIGIBLE SUPPLIERS OF ROCK PRODUCTS  
MAY 1, 1988 THROUGH APRIL 30, 1989

**11568**

ATTACHMENT "A" TO RESOLUTION NO. \_\_\_\_\_

ELIGIBLE SUPPLIER	PIT/QUARRY LOCATION	PITRUM GRAVEL	1/2 - 1/4 COVERSTONE	5/8 MINUS COVERSTONE	3/4 CRUSH SCREENINGS SURFACING	6-IN MINUS ROCK	RIP RAP	DITCH ARMOR ROCK	Note #
B. A. VAN DE GRIFT	CLEAR LAKE	PO \$1.20/C.Y. LP \$1.50/C.Y.	\$3.30/C.Y. \$3.60/C.Y.	\$3.30/C.Y. \$3.60/C.Y.	\$8.00/C.Y. \$8.30/C.Y.	\$3.40/C.Y. \$3.70/C.Y.			
ASSOCIATED SAND & GRAVEL	BURLINGTON AND ARLINGTON	PO \$1.00/TON LP \$1.50/TON	\$4.25/TON \$4.25/TON	\$4.00/TON \$4.00/TON	\$1.00/TON \$1.50/TON				
CONCRETE NORTHWEST	SAMISH PIT	PO \$1.50/TON LP \$1.50/TON	\$4.25/TON \$4.25/TON	\$3.85/TON	\$3.50/TON				
LAKESIDE INDUSTRIES	HAVEKOST ROAD ANACORTES	PO \$1.50/TON LP \$2.00/TON	\$7.00/TON \$7.50/TON	\$5.85/TON \$6.35/TON	\$8.50/TON \$9.00/TON		\$5.00/TON \$9.50/TON		Note B
LAKESIDE INDUSTRIES	HWY 93 NORTH BURLINGTON	PO \$4.80/TON LP \$5.30/TON							

NOTES:

PO = PRODUCT ONLY  
LP = LOADED PRODUCT

A: 5/8 MINUS COVERSTONE ONLY AT BURLINGTON

B: RIP RAP IS 18" TO 6"